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$ike "l,.;-_é¢ W B " eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
S nga .
AV f;*_ t Ie Tender Details
renacers Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:27 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 13 DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558948_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online  |ls,No [Bank Name Cover .
: Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf EMD
/Technical
.pdf NIT
TENDER
-pdf FORM
df CREDENTIAL
P (OPTIONAL)
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA, TRADE LICENCE, COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
5 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ 5,665 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee No ]
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

Click to view modification history

22/8/2023 12:27 PM
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Work /Item(s)

Title

CONSTRUCTION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF BISHU GAIN TO THE
FRONT OF HOUSE OF NIKHIL GAIN ALONG WITH PROTECTION WALL FOR STRENTHENING OF ROAD IN

WARD NO 14 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Work Description

CONSTRUCTION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF BISHU GAIN TO THE
FRONT OF HOUSE OF NIKHIL GAIN ALONG WITH PROTECTION WALL FOR STRENTHENING OF ROAD IN

WARD NO 14 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Pre Qualification

Please refer Tender documents.

Details

Independent External |NA

Monitor/Remarks

Show Tender Value in |Yes

Public Domain

Tender Value in ¥ 2,83,125 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA

WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |15

Location WARD NO 14 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
DAINHAT

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT

Address MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No

Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Date

Document Download / Sale Start

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End

Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT .
Document S.No|(Document Name Description D_ocument Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 618.32

Work Item -
Documents ||/S.No/Document Type Document Name Description z:c:;;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164533.xls BOQ 239.50
Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 702.42!

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Rank Type

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No
status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3
model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public

Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

22/8/2023 12:27 PM
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Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 04:33 PM

22/8/2023 12:27 PM
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a‘;fj"’ ‘l,_;;é.: W B " eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
*%* est benga X
Mt = . Tender Details
& é% ienuern Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:20 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 11 DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558880_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf nit
/Technical
.pdf emd
.pdf tender form
credential
-pdf (optional)
2 Finance Xls bog
detailed
-pdf estimate
Other Important Documents
S.No [Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee Details, [Total Feein ¥ * - 0. EMD Fee D il
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ |3,305 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee No -
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history

22/8/2023 12:20 PM
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Work /Item(s)

Title

Repairing Rehabilitation of Cement concret road in front of Mrinal Debnaths House also Construction of
Cement concret road beside Pritam Club to near Samir SarkaRs house in ward no 12 Under Dainhat

Municipality

Work Description

Repairing Rehabilitation of Cement concret road in front of Mrinal Debnats House also Construction of
Cement concret road beside Pritam Club to near Samir Sarkars house in ward no 12 Under Dainhat

Municipality
Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents.
Details
Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in ¥ 1,65,246 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA

WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |15
Location WARD NO 12 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA

DAINHAT
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
Address MUNICIPALITY
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder
Critical Dates
Publish Date 21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM
Document Download / Sale Start |22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End 07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM
Date Date
Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT -
Document S.No|(Document Name Description D_ocument Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 866.55

Work Item -
Documents |/ S.No|Document Type Document Name Description z:c:;;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164410.xls BOQ 291.50
Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 364.58

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No
status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3
model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No
Rank Type

Show Bid Details in Public [Technical Bid Opening

Domain stage

22/8/2023 12:20 PM
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Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 03:24 PM

22/8/2023 12:20 PM
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$ike "l,.;-_é¢ W B " eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
est benga X
AV - h Tender Details
renacers Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:19 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 10 DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558861_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L
: Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf EMD
/Technical
TENDER
-pdf FORM
.pdf NIT
df CREDENTIAL
P (OPTIONAL)
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA, TRADE LICENCE, COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin ¥ [4,045 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee No -
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history

22/8/2023 12:19 PM
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Work /Item(s)

Title

Construction of cement concrete road alongwith side drain from the house of Pratap Mondal to Old K K Road

in Ward no 03 under Dainhat Municipality

Work Description

Construction of cement concrete road alongwith side drain from the house of Pratap Mondal to Old K K Road

in Ward no-03 under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification

Please refer Tender documents.

Details

Independent External |NA

Monitor/Remarks

Show Tender Value in |Yes

Public Domain

Tender Value in X 2,02,043 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA

WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |15

Location WARD NO 03 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
DAINHAT

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT

Address MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No

Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End

Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender D men
NIT .
Document S.No|(Document Name Description D'ocument Size
(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 865.35
Work Item i
Documents |/S.No/Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c;;;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164379.xls BOQ 240.00
Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 986.60

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharyal964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No
status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3
model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

Show Bid Details in Public

Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

22/8/2023 12:19 PM
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Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 02:56 PM

22/8/2023 12:19 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details
Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:18 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 09DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558847_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L.
= Cover Document Type |Description
Bankers [y I1cc1 BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT
/Technical
.pdf EMD
.pdf TENDER FORM
.pdf CREDENTIAL(OPTIONAL)
2 Finance Xls BOQ
.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA TRADE LICENCE, COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ 3,935 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST 9" EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee No )
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history
Work /Item(s)
Title Construction of Drain fom the house of Shanti Biswas to Hunuman Lathitala at Bikihat Along with
Instrallation of Stand Post in Ward No14 Under Dainhat Municipality

22/8/2023 12:19 PM
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Work Description Construction of Drain fom the house of Shanti Biswas to Hunuman Lathitala at Bikihat Along with
Instrallation of Stand Post in Ward No14 Under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents.

Details

Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks

Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain

Tender Value in X 1,96,574 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA
WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |NA
Location WARD NO 14 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA

DAINHAT
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
Address MUNICIPALITY
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM
Document Download / Sale Start |22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End 07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM
Date Date

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA

Bid Submission Start Date 22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT .

Document S.No|Document Name Description I()i:c:;;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 619.10

Work Item i

Documents |/S.No/Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c:;;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164349.xls BOQ 240.00
2 /Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 1540.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharyal964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA

2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes

Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No

status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3

model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

Show Bid Details in Public [Technical Bid Opening

Domain stage

Tender Inviting Authority
Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY
Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

20f3 22/8/2023 12:19 PM
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Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 02:31 PM

22/8/2023 12:19 PM



eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

1of3

https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details
Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:15 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 07DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558803_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L
: Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf EMD
/Technical
.pdf TENDERFORM
.pdf NIT
df CREDENTIAL
P (OPTIONAL)
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No [Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA TRADE LICENCE,COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee Details, [Total Feein ¥ * - 0. EMD Fee D il
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ |8,070 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee No -
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history

22/8/2023 12:15 PM
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Work /Item(s)

Title

Construction of Drain from Dharmarajtala towards Late Narayan Chandra Saha via the house of Urmila Saha

in Ward no 03 under Dainhat Municipality

Work Description

Construction of Drain from Dharmarajtala towards Late Narayan Chandra Saha via the house of Urmila Saha

in Ward no 03 under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification

Please refer Tender documents.

Details
Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in X 4,03,312 Product Category CIVIL Sub category
WORKS
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days)
Location WARD NO 03 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place
DAINHAT
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date [NA Bid Opening Place
Address MUNICIPALITY
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End

Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender D men

NIT

Document S.No|Document Name

Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf

NIT

619.78

Work Item
Documents |/ S.No|Document Type

Document Name

Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ

BOQ_1164266.xls

BOQ

240.00

Additional Documents

estimate.pdf

DETAILEDESTIMATE

756.69

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharyal964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No
status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3
model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

Show Bid Details in Public

Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

22/8/2023 12:15 PM
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Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY DAINHAT PURBA BARDHAMAN

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 01:42 PM

22/8/2023 12:15 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details
Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:13 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 06DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558770_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online |5 No [Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers [y I1cc1 BANK No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf EMD
/Technical
TENDER
-pdf FORM
.pdf NIT
df CREDENTIAL
P (OPTIONAL)
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
4 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in X * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ |4,510 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee No )
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history
Work /Item(s
Title Construction of cement concrete road with side protection from the house of Ananda Banerjee to the house
of Dranacharya Sanyasi Along with Cross Drain in Ward No 03 Under Dainhat Municipality

22/8/2023 12:14 PM
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Work Description

Construction of cement concrete road with side protection from the house of Ananda Banerjee to the house

https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

of Dranacharya Sanyasi Along with Cross Drain in Ward No 03 Under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification

Please refer Tender documents.

Details

Independent External |NA

Monitor/Remarks

Show Tender Value in |Yes

Public Domain

Tender Value in X 2,25,329 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA

WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |15

Location WARD NO 03 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
DAINHAT

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT

Address MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No

Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Date

Document Download / Sale Start

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End

Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT .
Document S.No|(Document Name Description I()i:c:;;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 619.21
Work Item i
Documents |/S.No/Document Type Document Name Description I()i:c:;;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164229.xls BOQ 228.00
2 /Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 1010.06

Bid Openers List

Rank Type

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharyal964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY
Tender Properties

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No
status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3
model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY DAINHAT PURBA BARDHAMAN

22/8/2023 12:14 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 01:02 PM

22/8/2023 12:14 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

$ike "l,.;-_é¢ W B " eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
est benga X
AV - h Tender Details
renacers Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:11 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 05DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558753_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf EMD
/Technical
TENDER
-pdf FORM
.pdf NIT
df CREDENTIAL
P ( OPTIONAL )
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA, TRADE LICENCE, COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee Details, [Total Feein ¥ * - 0. EMD Fee D il
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ (4,386 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee No -
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history

22/8/2023 12:12 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Work /Item(s)

Title

Repairing and Rehabilitation of Cement Concrete Road Along with Side drain from the House of Mihir Sarkar

to the House of Chhattu Majhi in Ward No-04 under Dainhat Muncipality

Work Description

Repairing and Rehabilitation of Cement Concrete Road Along with Side drain from the House of Mihir Sarkar

to the House of Chhattu Majhi in Ward No 04 under Dainhat Muncipality

Pre Qualification

Please refer Tender documents.

Details
Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in X 2,19,277 Product Category CIVIL Sub category
WORKS
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days)
Location WARD NO 04 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place
DAINHAT
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place
Address MUNICIPALITY
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No

Tender

Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End

Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender D men

NIT

Document S.No|Document Name

Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf

NIT

619.41

Work Item

Documents |/S.No/Document Type

Document Name

Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ

BOQ_1164204.xls

BOQ

228.00

Additional Documents

estimate.pdf

DETAILED ESTIMATE

814.15

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharyal964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No
status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3
model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

Show Bid Details in Public

Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

22/8/2023 12:12 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY DAINHAT PURBA BARDHAMAN

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 12:27 PM

22/8/2023 12:12 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

e “{;-_y W B " eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
est benga X
AV - h Tender Details
renacers Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:17 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 08DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558823_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf nit
/Technical
.pdf EMD
TENDER
-pdf FORM
df CREDENTIAL
P (OPTIONAL)
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA, TRADE LICENCE, COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee D Total Feein X * - 0. EMD Fee D il
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin ¥ (4,435 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee -
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history

22/8/2023 12:17 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Work /Item(s)

Title

Construction and Installation Iron Structure of SWM Dustbin in Different Wards under Dainhat Municipality

Work Description

Construction and Installation Iron Structure of SWM Dustbin in Different Wards under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification

Please refer Tender documents.

Details

Independent External |NA

Monitor/Remarks

Show Tender Value in |Yes

Public Domain

Tender Value in X 2,21,690 |Product Category CIVIL WORKS |Sub category NA
Contract Type Tender |Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |15
Location DAINHAT |Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY
Address

Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No

Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Date

Document Download / Sale End

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender D men

NIT .

Document S.No|(Document Name Description D'ocument Size

(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 865.42

Work Item "

Documents |/S.No/Document Type Document Name Description I()i:cll(lg;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164301.xls BOQ 240.00
2 Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 1101.41

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA

2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes

Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No

status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3

model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Rank Type

Show Bid Details in Public [Technical Bid Opening

Domain stage

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

22/8/2023 12:17 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 02:05 PM

22/8/2023 12:17 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
Tender Details
Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:21 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 12 DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558904_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L
: Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf NIT
/Technical
.pdf EMD
TENDER
-pdf FORM
.pdf CREDENTIAL
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No [Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Bank Solvency Certificate Bank Solvency Certificate
4 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
5 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA, TRADE LICENCE, COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
6 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 2 COMPANY DETAILS 2
7 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
] FINANCIAL INFO 2020-21 2020-21
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
9 FINANCIAL INFO 2021-22 2021-22
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
10 FINANCIAL INFO 2022-23 2022-23
Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ¥ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ |10,612 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At ‘Nil BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

22/8/2023 12:21 PM
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Tender Fee No

Exemption Allowed

https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

EMD Fee Type fixed

EMD Percentage

NA

EMD Payable To Nil

EMD Payable At

Nil

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title PROTECTION OF ROAD BY EUCALYPTUS BULLAH PILING BY THE SIDE OF JAME MASJID IN WARD NO 09
UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY
Work Description PROTECTION OF ROAD BY EUCALYPTUS BULLAH PILING BY THE SIDE OF JAME MASJID IN WARD NO 09
UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY
Pre Qualification Please refer Tender documents.
Details
Independent External |NA
Monitor/Remarks
Show Tender Value in |Yes
Public Domain
Tender Value in X 5,30,610 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA
WORKS
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |15
Location WARD NO 9 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
DAINHAT
Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date [NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
Address MUNICIPALITY
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No
Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start

Date

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End

Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents

NIT .
Document S.No|(Document Name Description I()i:c;;;ent Size
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 622.04
Work Item "
Documents ||S-No|/Document Type Document Name Description I()i:cll(lg;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164445.xls BOQ 240.00
2 /Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 474.77

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Show Technical bid status

Yes

Auto Tendering No
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes
status

Show Bids Details

No

BoQ Comparative Chart

model

Normal

BoQ Compartive chart decimal places

22/8/2023 12:21 PM
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BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L

https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Form Based BoQ

No

Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Cr rD

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 03:45 PM

22/8/2023 12:21 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

$ike "l,.;-_é¢ W B " eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal
est benga X
AV - h Tender Details
renacers Date : 22-Aug-2023 12:28 PM
&) Print
Basic Details
Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT
Tender Reference 14 DM/ENGG, DT-21/08/2023
Number
Tender ID 2023_MAD_558965_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage
Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2
General Technical No ItemWise Technical Evaluation No
Evaluation Allowed Allowed
Payment Mode Online Is Multi Currency Allowed For No
BOQ
Is Multi Currency I
Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No
Payment Instruments Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2
Online S.No |[Bank Name Cover L
= Cover Document Type Description
Bankers |, [yc1cr Bank No
2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS 1 Fee/PreQual pdf EMD
/Technical
.pdf NIT
TENDER
-pdf FORM
df CREDENTIAL
P (OPTIONAL)
2 Finance Xls BOQ
df DETAILED
P ESTIMATE
Other Important Documents
S.No |Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File
VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE
2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number
PARTNERSHIP DEED,
CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETY BYLAW,
4 COMPANY DETAILS COMPANY DETAILS 1 MOA, TRADE LICENCE, COMPANY
REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1
Tender Fee D Total Feein X * - 0. EMD Fee D il
Tender Fee in ¥ 0.00 EMD Amountin¥ |7,865 EMD through Yes
Fee Payable To Fee Payable At il BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed
Tender Fee -
Exemption Allowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA
EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
Click to view modification history

22/8/2023 12:28 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Work /Item(s)

Title

REPAIRING AND REHABILITATION OF DRAIN FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF PARITOSH DAS TO THE
FRONT OF HOUSE OF FAZU SEKH AT MOKAM PARA IN WARD NO 14 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Work Description

REPAIRING AND REHABILITATION OF DRAIN FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF PARITOSH DAS TO THE
FRONT OF HOUSE OF FAZU SEKH AT MOKAM PARA IN WARD NO 14 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Pre Qualification

Please refer Tender documents.

Details

Independent External |NA

Monitor/Remarks

Show Tender Value in |Yes

Public Domain

Tender Value in X 3,93,059 Product Category CIVIL Sub category NA

WORKS

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) |15

Location WARD NO 14 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place |NA
DAINHAT

Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date |NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT

Address MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential No

Tender Bidder

Critical Dates

Publish Date

21-Aug-2023 06:00 PM

Bid Opening Date

11-Sep-2023 10:00 AM

Date

Document Download / Sale Start

22-Aug-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale End

Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date

NA

Clarification End Date

NA

Bid Submission Start Date

22-Aug-2023 02:00 PM

Bid Submission End Date

07-Sep-2023 06:00 PM

Tender D men
NIT .
Document S.No|(Document Name Description D_ocument Size
(in KB)
1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 618.40
Work Item "
Documents ||S-No|/Document Type Document Name Description I()i:cll(lg;ent Size
1 BOQ BOQ_1164579.xls BOQ 227.50
Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 603.08

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharyal964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman

3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Rank Type

Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes
Process allowed

Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No
status

BoQ Comparative Chart  [Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places |3
model

BoQ Comparative Chart  [L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public

Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

22/8/2023 12:28 PM
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https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view | &page=ViewT...

Tender Inviting Authority

Name

CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address

DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By

Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation

Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date

21-Aug-2023 05:03 PM

22/8/2023 12:28 PM



