
eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 21-Sep-2023 12:39 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

16DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573309_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf NIT

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf EMD

.pdf CREDENTIAL

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
7 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

9 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

10 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ₹ 4,810 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
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Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title REPAIR AND RREHABILITATION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF BIPUL
KUMAR TO KHETRANATH MUKHERJEES HOUSE IN WARD NO 04 UNDER DAINHAT

Work Description REPAIR AND RREHABILITATION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF BIPUL
KUMAR TO KHETRANATH MUKHERJEES HOUSE IN WARD NO 04 UNDER DAINHAT

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 2,40,467 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 15 

Location WARD NO 04
DAINHAT

Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 273.76

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1199482.xls BOQ 240.00
2 Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 423.75

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details No

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY DAINHAT PURBA BARDHAMAN

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 03:09 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 21-Sep-2023 12:51 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

22DM/ENGG, DT-21/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_574072_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf NIT

.pdf EMD

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf CREDENTIAL

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
7 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2019-20 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2019-20 

9 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

10 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ₹ 7,810 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil
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Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title CONSTRUCTION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE HOUSE OF GONU RAJOWAR TO THE HOUSE OF
SULEKHA BISWAS IN WARD NO 01 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Work Description CONSTRUCTION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE HOUSE OF GONU RAJOWAR TO THE HOUSE OF
SULEKHA BISWAS IN WARD NO 01 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 3,90,320 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 15 

Location WARD NO
01

Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 21-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

22-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 22-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 619.34

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1201502.xls BOQ 239.50
2 Additional Documents estimategonu.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 460.76

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details No

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 21-Sep-2023 12:06 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 21-Sep-2023 12:44 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

17DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573360_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf EMD

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf CREDENTIAL

.pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
4 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
6 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 

7 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

8 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

9 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ₹ 8,875 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

Click to view modification history
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Work /Item(s)

Title REPAIR AND REHABILITATION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF THE HOUSE OF
MITHUN RAJOWAR TO SANTOSH CHOWDHURYS HOUSE ALONG WITH SIDE PROTECTION WALL IN WARD
NO 02 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Work Description REPAIR AND REHABILITATION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF THE HOUSE OF
MITHUN RAJOWAR TO SANTOSH CHOWDHURYS HOUSE ALONG WITH SIDE PROTECTION WALL IN WARD
NO 02 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 4,43,709 Product Category CIVIL WORKS Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 15 

Location WARD NO 2 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 273.06

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1199713.xls BOQ 228.00
2 Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILTED ESTIMATE 461.57

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details No

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 04:09 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 21-Sep-2023 12:46 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

18DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573474_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf NIT

.pdf EMD

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf CREDENTIAL

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
7 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

9 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

10 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ₹ 4,105 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Work /Item(s)

Title REPAIR REHABILITATION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF VISALAXMI MANDIR TO
GIRIDHARI AGARWALS HOUSE VIA BIKASH ROYS HOUSE IN WARD NO 04 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Work Description REPAIR REHABILITATION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF VISALAXMI MANDIR TO
GIRIDHARI AGARWALS HOUSE VIA BIKASH ROYS HOUSE IN WARD NO 04 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 2,05,265 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) NA 

Location WARD NO 04
DAINHAT

Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 274.17

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1199856.xls BOQ 240.00
2 Additional Documents estimatevisa.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 380.18

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details No

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 04:40 PM
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 21-Sep-2023 12:50 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

09/1DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573611_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf NIT

.pdf EMD

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf CREDENTIAL

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
7 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

9 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

10 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ₹ 3,935 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title Construction of Drain fom the house of Shanti Biswas to Hunuman Lathitala at Bikihat Along with Installation
of Stand Post in Ward No14 Under Dainhat Municipality

Work Description Construction of Drain fom the house of Shanti Biswas to Hunuman Lathitala at Bikihat Along with Installation
of Stand Post in Ward No14 Under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 1,96,574 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 15 

Location WARD NO 14
DAINHAT

Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:30 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 864.48

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1200222.xls BOQ 240.00
2 Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 1540.50

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details No

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 05:56 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 21-Sep-2023 12:47 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

19DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573561_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf EMD

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf CREDENTIAL

.pdf NIT

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
7 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 

8 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

9 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

10 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ₹ 4,431 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title Extention of Pipe line for Drinking Water Purpose Restoration of Road from By the Side of Kalna Katwa Road
or the House of Pradip Roy to Bishnupada Sarkars house in ward no 02 under Dainhat Municipality

Work Description Extention of Pipe line for Drinking Water Purpose Restoration of Road from By the Side of Kalna Katwa Road
or the House of Pradip Roy to Bishnupada Sarkars house in ward no 02 under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 2,21,527 Product Category CIVIL WORKS Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) NA 

Location WARD NO 2 Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 273.32

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1200080.xls BOQ 291.00
2 Additional Documents estimatepradip.pdf detailed estimate 972.08

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details No

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 05:22 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Sep-2023 02:51 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

21 DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573258_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf NIT

.pdf EMD

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf CREDENTIAL

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Bank Solvency Certificate Bank Solvency Certificate 
5 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
7 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
8 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 
9 EQUIPMENT MACHINERIES 1 MACHINERIES 1 
10 EQUIPMENT MACHINERIES 2 MACHINERIES 2 

11 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

12 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

13 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

14 MANPOWER 
TECHNICAL PERSONNEL ON
CONTRACT 

TECHNICAL PERSONNEL ON
CONTRACT 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

EMD Fee Details

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=...
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Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Amount in ₹ 15,199 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title Improvement of riding quality of Bituminous road from Dainhat STKK LINK Road to Paresh Ghoshs House In
ward no 11 under Dainhat Municipality

Work Description Improvement of riding quality of Bituminous road from DainhatSTKK LINK Road to Paresh Ghoshs House In
ward no11 under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

No 

Tender Value in ₹ 7,59,935 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 30 

Location WARD NO 11
DAINHAT

Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 273.59

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1199334.xls BOQ 291.50
2 Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 770.43

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=...
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Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY DAINHAT PURBA BARDHAMAN

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 02:42 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=...
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 20-Sep-2023 02:28 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

20 DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573209_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf NIT

.pdf EMD

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

.pdf CREDENTIAL

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Bank Solvency Certificate Bank Solvency Certificate 
5 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
7 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
8 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 
9 EQUIPMENT MACHINERIES 1 MACHINERIES 1 
10 EQUIPMENT MACHINERIES 2 MACHINERIES 2 

11 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2020-21 

12 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2021-22 

13 FINANCIAL INFO 
P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

P/L AND BALANCE SHEET
2022-23 

14 MANPOWER 
TECHNICAL PERSONNEL ON
CONTRACT 

TECHNICAL PERSONNEL ON
CONTRACT 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

EMD Fee Details

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=...
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Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Amount in ₹ 45,025 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title Improvement of riding quality of Bituminous road from the shop of Commercial house to Shabori Cinema hall
In ward no 05 06 12 under Dainhat Municipality

Work Description Improvement of riding quality of Bituminous road from the shop of Commercial house to Shabori Cinema hall
In ward no 05 06 12 under Dainhat Municipality

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

No 

Tender Value in ₹ 22,51,230 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 30 

Location WARD NO 05 06 12
DAINHAT

Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 06:00 PM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 273.87

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1199186.xls BOQ 240.00
2 Additional Documents estimateshubash.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 925.44

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=...
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Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details Yes

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY DAINHAT PURBA BARDHAMAN

Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 02:17 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=$DirectLink&page=...
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eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal

Tender Details

Date : 21-Sep-2023 12:37 PM

 Print

Basic Details

Organisation Chain MUNICIPAL AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT||URBAN LOCAL BODIES||DAINHAT

Tender Reference
Number

15DM/ENGG, DT-20/09/2023

Tender ID 2023_MAD_573104_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes

Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Percentage

Tender Category Works No. of Covers 2

General Technical
Evaluation Allowed

No
ItemWise Technical Evaluation
Allowed

No

Payment Mode Online
Is Multi Currency Allowed For
BOQ

No

Is Multi Currency
Allowed For Fee

No Allow Two Stage Bidding No

Payment Instruments
Online
Bankers

S.No Bank Name

1 ICICI BANK

2 ICICI NEFT/RTGS

Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2

Cover
No

Cover Document Type Description

1
Fee/PreQual
/Technical

.pdf NIT

.pdf EMD

.pdf CREDENTIAL

.pdf
TENDER
FORM

2 Finance .xls BOQ

.pdf
DETAILED
ESTIMATE

Other Important Documents

S.No Category Sub Category Sub Category Description Format/File

1 CERTIFICATES CERTIFICATES 

VAT/SALES TAX REGISTRATION
CERTIFICATE ALONG WITH
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT , PAN,
LATEST IT ACKNOWLEDGEMENT,
PTAX,LABOUR LICENCE 

2 CERTIFICATES Provident Fund Certificate Provident Fund Certificate 
3 CERTIFICATES GST Registration Certificate GST Registration Certificate 
4 CERTIFICATES Permanent Account Number Permanent Account Number 
5 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 1 CREDENTIAL 1 
6 CREDENTIAL CREDENTIAL 2 COMPLETION CERTIFICATES 
7 DECLARATION DECLARATION FILE 1 DECLARATION FILE 1 

Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00]

Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00

Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil

Tender Fee
Exemption Allowed

No

EMD Fee Details

EMD Amount in ₹ 3,955 EMD through
BG/ST or EMD
Exemption Allowed

Yes

EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA

EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil

Click to view modification history

Work /Item(s)

Title CONSTRUCTION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF BIBOBRATA SARKAR TO
ITI MAJUMDARSS HOUSE IN WARD NO 10 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Work Description CONSTRUCTION OF CEMENT CONCRETE ROAD FROM THE FRONT OF HOUSE OF BIBOBRATA SARKAR TO
ITI MAJUMDARSS HOUSE IN WARD NO 10 UNDER DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Pre Qualification
Details

Please refer Tender documents. 

Independent External
Monitor/Remarks

NA 

Show Tender Value in
Public Domain

Yes 

Tender Value in ₹ 1,97,702 Product Category CIVIL
WORKS

Sub category NA 

Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 120 Period Of Work(Days) 15 

Location WARD NO
10

Pincode 713502 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 

Pre Bid Meeting
Address

NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DAINHAT
MUNICIPALITY

Should Allow NDA
Tender

No Allow Preferential
Bidder

No

Critical Dates

Publish Date 20-Sep-2023 06:00 PM Bid Opening Date 10-Oct-2023 10:00 AM

Document Download / Sale Start
Date

21-Sep-2023 10:00 AM Document Download / Sale End
Date

07-Oct-2023 11:00 AM

Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 

Bid Submission Start Date 21-Sep-2023 02:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 07-Oct-2023 11:00 AM

Tender Documents
NIT
Document S.No Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 Tendernotice_1.pdf NIT 273.08

Work Item
Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description

Document Size
(in KB)

1 BOQ BOQ_1199041.xls BOQ 228.00
2 Additional Documents estimate.pdf DETAILED ESTIMATE 369.00

Bid Openers List

S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name

1. sudiptabhattacharya1964@gmail.com SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA SUDIPTA BHATTACHARYA
2. mdhabib.wbaas@gmail.com Habibur Rahman Md Habibur Rahman
3. pradipkumar.roy1948@gmail.com Pradip Kumar Roy PRADIP KUMAR ROY

Tender Properties

Auto Tendering
Process allowed

No Show Technical bid status Yes

Show Finance bid
status

Yes Show Bids Details No

BoQ Comparative Chart
model

Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 3

BoQ Comparative Chart
Rank Type

L Form Based BoQ No

Show Bid Details in Public
Domain stage

Technical Bid Opening

Tender Inviting Authority

Name CHAIRMAN DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY

Address DAINHAT MUNICIPALITY DAINHAT PURBA BARDHAMAN

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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Tender Creator Details

Created By Pradip Kumar Roy

Designation Chairman, Dainhat Municipality

Created Date 20-Sep-2023 01:47 PM

eProcurement System of Government of West Bengal https://wbtenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=view1&page=ViewT...
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